
  

Commitment of the Participants
Do not divulge video/sound/picture recordings 
to others outside of the workshop 
(without explicit consent of the persons involved).

Do not record the talks without agreement of the speaker.

Do not record the discussions without agreement of all participants.

Do not divulge without agreement of the participants.

Do not take a public position involving the group of participants.
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Participants

Specialists of diverse fields, all trying to elucidate the origins of SARS-
CoV-2.

Goals of the Workshop

(1) Elucidate the origins of SARS-CoV-2

(2) Foster discussions and collaborations between researchers from 
various relevant fields (virology, modelling, bioinformatics, ecology, 
social sciences, etc.) working on the origin of SARS-CoV-2.

(3) Have a general overview of the different types of evidence and 
approaches currently undertaken to investigate the origin of the virus.

(4) Apply an evidence-based analysis to evaluate the different 
hypotheses about the origin of the virus.



  

Commitment of the Participants

Adopt an open attitude to alternative hypotheses.

Distinguish clearly facts from interpretations and opinions.

Focus on facts and scientific debate.

Avoid personal attacks (during and after the workshop).

Avoid self-interest biasing the participation.



  

Always 3rd Thursday, every 4 months 
(Jan, May, Sept)
Usually 3-6pm Paris time

Next ones:
19 Sept 2024
16 Jan 2025

For workshop questions 
please email François and José 

Next sessions



  

All my introduction slides are available online

https://courtier.ijm.fr/news-covid-origin/ 



  
https://github.com/jbloom/SARS2_28Dec2019_Genbank_submission/blob/main/README.md

17 Jan 2024

“Sequence submi
ed to NCBI's Genbank database by the Ins�tute of Pathogen Biology 
of the Chinese Academy of Medical Sciences.

The sequence is in Pango clade B and contains three single-nucleo�de di&erences from 
the Wuhan-Hu-1 reference.  ”



  

17 Jan 2024

DEFUSE complete drafts 
FOIA by USRTK and @gumby4christ from the US Geological Survey 

https://www.biorxiv.org/content/10.1101/2022.10.18.512756v1

https://archive.org/details/2021-006245-combined-records-redacted/page/n337/mode/2up

Plan  to buy BsmBI restriction enzyme



  

18 Jan 2024

https://usrtk.org/covid-19-origins/scientists-proposed-making-viruses-with-unique-features-of-sars-cov-2-in-wuhan/



  

19 Jan 2024

https://usrtk.org/covid-19-origins/scientists-proposed-making-viruses-with-unique-features-of-sars-cov-2-in-wuhan/

“I requested [to  Edinburgh University] Rambaut’s email discussions with Farrar, Fauci, 
Holmes and Danish evolu�onary biologist Kris�an Andersen in rela�on to that 
controversial Nature Medicine document.

IIt rebu&ed my request in an eight-page le
er from its legal chief. ”



  

22 Jan 2024

https://oversight.house.gov/release/new-select-subcommittee-report-recommends-ecohealth-alliance-president-debarred-and-
criminally-investigated-exposes-failures-in-nih-grant-procedures/

House Select Subcommittee hearing on the Coronavirus 
Pandemic on Capitol Hill

2 Nov 2023: Michael Lauer, deputy director for extramural research at the NIH
14 Nov 2024: Peter Daszak, president of EcoHealth Alliance
28 Nov 2023: Emily Erbelding, director of the Division of Microbiology and 
Infectious Diseases at the National Institute of Allergy and Infectious Diseases 
(NIAID)
29 Dec 2023: David Morens (Part 1), Senior Advisor to the Director at National 
Institute of Allergy and Infectious Diseases (NIAID)
18 Jan 2024:  David Morens (Part 2)
5 Jan 2024: Lawrence A. Tabak, Director of the National Institutes of Health 
2021-2023
22 Jan 2024: Ralph Baric, coronavirus researcher at The University of North 
Carolina at Chapel Hill.



  

23 Jan 2024

https://public.substack.com/p/in-early-2020-a-chinese-source-trusted



  

24 Jan 2024

https://blogs.bmj.com/medical-ethics/2024/01/24/negligence-by-experts-in-the-early-response-to-covid-19/



  

25 Jan 2024

https://www.city-journal.org/article/new-documents-bolster-lab-leak-hypothesis

“The new [DEFUSE] drafts show the authors planned to synthesize eight to 16 
strains of SARS-type bat viruses, selected for their likely ability to infect human 
cells. The goal was to use them to make a vaccine to immunize bats in regions that 
military troops might have to enter.

In a note found in the new documents, Daszak wrote, “If we win this contract, I do 
not propose that all of this work will necessarily be conducted by Ralph, but I do 
want to stress the US side of this proposal so that DARPA are comfortable with our 
team. Once we get the funds, we can then allocate who does what exact work, and 
I believe that a lot of these assays can be done in Wuhan.

The DEFUSE procedure was to assemble the viral genome from 6 DNA sections.”



  

2 Feb 2024

https://gcrinstitute.org/covid-origin/



  

5 Feb 2024

Update 7 Mar 2024

https://cards.rootclaim.com/analysis/65892f07d97bdb00199d4366
https://blog.rootclaim.com/rootclaims-covid-19-origins-debate-results/

Peter Miller (@tgof137) 
won the challenge.

https://cards.rootclaim.com/analysis/65892f07d97bdb00199d4366
https://twitter.com/tgof137


  

2 March 2024

https://www.telegraph.co.uk/global-health/science-and-disease/covid-origins-wuhan-theory-book-dali-yang/

Dali Yang, political 
scientist at the 
University of Chicago, 
leading authority on 
the Chinese political 
system



  

5 Mar 2024

https://academic.oup.com/ve/article/10/1/veae020/7619252?login=false
https://x.com/jbloom_lab/status/1765163319814684901?s=20 

https://academic.oup.com/ve/article/10/1/veae020/7619252?login=false
https://x.com/jbloom_lab/status/1765163319814684901?s=20


  

9 Mar 2024

https://arxiv.org/abs/2403.05859



  

15 Mar 2024

https://onlinelibrary.wiley.com/doi/10.1111/risa.14291



  

16 Mar 2024

https://biosafetynow.org/raina-macintyre-daring-to-ask-about-the-origins-of-sars-cov-2/



  

12 April 2024

https://www.ecohealthalliance.org/2024/04/ecohealth-alliance-releases-emails-that-are-the-subject-of-false-allegations-in-the-press



  

17 April 2024

https://www-annualreviews-org.insb.bib.cnrs.fr/content/journals/10.1146/annurev-virology-093022-013037

“The available data clearly point to a natural zoonotic emergence within, or 
closely linked to, the Huanan Seafood Wholesale Market in Wuhan. There is 
no direct evidence linking the emergence of SARS-CoV-2 to laboratory work 
conducted at the Wuhan Institute of Virology. “



  

22 April 2024

https://apnews.com/article/china-covid-virus-origins-pandemic-lab-leak-bed5ab50dca8e318ab00f60b5911da0c

“The head of the China CDC Institute of Viral Disease was forced to retire over the 
release of the market data, according to a former China CDC official who declined to be 
named to speak on a sensitive topic.”

Dake Kang and Maria Cheng



  

30 April 2024

https://usrtk.org/covid-19-origins/scientists-proposed-making-viruses-with-unique-features-of-sars-cov-2-in-wuhan/

“Zhang Yongzhen wrote in an online post Monday that he and his team 
had been suddenly notified they were being evicted from their lab”



  

1 May 2024

https://www.vanityfair.com/news/story/ralph-baric-wuhan-lab-leak

“On January 22, he gave a six-hour interview to investigators from two 
Republican-led House committees: the Oversight and Accountability’s 
Select Subcommittee on the Coronavirus Pandemic, and Energy and 
Commerce’s Subcommittee on Oversight and Investigations.”



  

1 May 2024

https://www.statnews.com/2024/05/01/covid-lab-leak-theory-ecohealth-federal-funds/

Republicans, in particular, are asking the administration to immediately debar the 
research group EcoHealth Alliance, and to refer the case to law enforcement. 
Democrats, in a separate report, did not go that far but said that documents and 
testimonies “raise reasonable questions” about the organization receiving any future 
taxpayer funding.

https://oversight.house.gov/wp-content/uploads/2024/04/2024.05.01-SSCP-Report_FINAL.pdf
https://oversightdemocrats.house.gov/sites/evo-subsites/democrats-oversight.house.gov/files/evo-media-document/SSCP%20EHA%20Democratic%20Staff%20Report_FINAL.pdf


  

1 May 2024

https://x.com/Jim_Jordan/status/1785753838080733319

White House



  

6 May 2024

https://journals.plos.org/plospathogens/article?id=10.1371/journal.ppat.1012204

“Biochemical data showed that raccoon dog ACE2 is an effective receptor for 
SARS-CoV-2 spike protein, though not as effective as human ACE2. Structural 
comparisons highlighted differences in the virus-binding residues of raccoon dog 
ACE2 compared to human ACE2 (L24Q, Y34H, E38D, T82M, R353K), explaining 
their varied effectiveness as receptors for SARS-CoV-2.”



  

9 May 2024

https://www.science.org/doi/10.1126/science.adq2379



  

12 May 2024

https://www.spiked-online.com/2024/05/12/the-truth-about-covids-origins-is-finally-coming-out/



  

13 May 2024

https://arxiv.org/abs/2405.08040



  

15 May 2024

https://x.com/COVIDSelect/status/1790762368898654308
https://oversight.house.gov/wp-content/uploads/2024/05/Tab-1-EHA-SUSP4D-Notice_5.15.2024_signed.pdf  

https://x.com/COVIDSelect/status/1790762368898654308
https://oversight.house.gov/wp-content/uploads/2024/05/Tab-1-EHA-SUSP4D-Notice_5.15.2024_signed.pdf


  

All my introduction slides are available online

https://courtier.ijm.fr/news-covid-origin/ 


